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Black Men Missing – The Vacant Pews
Why are They M.I.A. on Sundays?

Duane “Dog” Chapman Owes No Apology

The Nationalist
Black Leadership
Coalition is Born

By Jeff Johnson
Ok. So here we go

again…Black people up
in arms about a white
man in the public eye
calling someone the
dreaded N-word.
Before I comment, it is
important that I say
that I don’t believe that
the word should be
used as a term of
endearment. I also
believe that people that
have access to airwaves
have to be sensitive, at

Banks of Dallas
Ministries, North
Dallas Gazette and the
Elite News will present
an open community
forum discussion enti-
tled: Black Men
Missing – The Vacant
Pews. The public is

invited to attend and
participate in an
open community
discussion on the
subject of Black Men
missing from the
local churches. Rev.
F. Karl Banks of
Banks of Dallas

M i n i s t r i e s
( w w w. b o d m . o r g ) ,
Johnson chapel
Community Church –
Sr. Pastor Dr. Karen
Hollie, North Dallas
Gazette and The Elite
News invite the public

best, about how they uti-
lize those airwaves. I
have dedicated my pro-
fessional career to fight-
ing social injustice and
ensuring that African
Americans in particular,
are not cast in a pejora-
tive by the media. But
here it is……..

Duane "Dog"
Chapman goes on a rant
on a voice message about
N-word this and n-word
that, voicing his obvious

disgust at the thought
of a family member
dating an N-word. He
further concludes by
stating that he would
advise that family
member to refrain from
dating this person, as
he did not wish to risk
his career by using the
N-word on TV. I am
more appalled by this
tirade than by the racist
rants of Imus, Michael
Richards, and Mel

By: James Clingman
NNPA Columnist
“The Negroes of the

United States have fol-
lowed leadership slav-
ishly, but sometimes
unfortunately that of
those leaders who are
selected for them by
the traducers of the
race. The enemies of
the race, for example,
will find a Negro will-
ing to do certain things
they desire to have
accomplished and will
finance him and give
him sufficient publicity
to get before the world,
for the few favors
which he may dispense
among his followers as
a result of his influence
and economic position
will bring to him the
adequate number of

Negroes for the con-
stituency which he
desires.” Carter G.
Woodson, The Mis-
Education of the
Negro.

On October 11,
2007, a date we should
all remember anyway
because now two of our
beloved brothers,
Kenneth Bridges and
M u h a m m a d
Nasserdeen, died on
that date, the
Nationalist Black
Leadership Coalition
(NBLC) was born in
Kernersville, North
Carolina. As death is
always present, life con-
tinues to follow. Shortly
after we got the news of
Nasserdeen’s transition

Black Coalition, Page 12

Douglass 
Community Center 

Girl  Talk 2007 Cotillion

Democrats Refuse To Nominate A Black Person For President
By Frances Rice
Four times

Democratic Party pri-
mary voters had a
chance to select a
black person as their
party's nominee for
president. Each time
the Democrats turned
their backs on the
black presidential can-
didates: Shirley
Chisholm who became
the first black and the

first woman to run for
president in 1972;
Senator Carol Mosely
Braum; Rev. Jesse
Jackson; and Rev. Al
Sharpton.

Now the Democrats
have another chance.
It's obvious, though,
judging from recent
polls, that the
Democratic Party pri-
mary voters will
choose yet another

white person, Senator
Hillary Clinton, over
black Senator Barrack
Obama (the son of a
white American
woman and a man
from Kenya) to be the
Democratic Party's
presidential nominee.
To make matters even
worse, the Democrats
are trying to derail
Obama's candidacy by
demeaning him as a

"Magic Negro," using
that racist term in a
Los Angeles Times
article entitled:
Obama the "Magic
Negro".

Political pundit
Robert Novak opined
that the Democrats
have no interest in a
black man being their
presidential nominee
because "as an

Democrats, Page 2
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2007 Cotillion Committee (Lt to Rt) Dianne
Dillon,Vivian York, Eleanor Evans,

Stacey Green, Loretta Anderson.
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¥ If you qualify. *Fees quoted above are minimum down payment needed to begin processing your case.

2730 N. Stemmons Frwy, Suite 409 • Dallas, TX 75207

817-277-0196 (Metro)

Open On Weekends

$69* DIVORCE
Family Cases

• Divorce / Annulment

• Child Support / Paternity

• Custody Modification

• Restraining Order

• Protective Order

• Name Change / Adoption

• Domestic Violence

Criminal Defense
• DWI / Suspended License

• WARRANTS Removed ¥

• 24 Hour Jail Release ¥

• Occupational license, felonies

• Protective Order

• Misdeamenor/Felonies ¥

Open On Weekends Easy Payment PlansEasy Payment Plans

214-638-5930
Law Offices Of Vincent NdukweLaw Offices Of Vincent Ndukwe

ADI’s professional services were
instrumental in the construction of

the Zuma Entertainment Center.

WE PROVIDE PROFESSIONAL

ENGINEERING,
ARCHITECTURAL,

ENVIRONMENTAL AND

SCIENTIFIC RESEARCH

SERVICES TO THE WORLD

8035 E. R.L. Thorton Frwy., Suite 605 • Dallas, TX 75228
(214) 760-7112 • (214) 242-2742 fax

www.adiassociatesinc.com • adiengineering@sbcglobal.net
Don Anyanwu, Ph.D., P.E., CEM - President

Democrats, Page 1
African-American from
Illinois, Obama repre-
sents an ethnic group
and a state already
solidly in the
Democratic column."
In other words,
Democrats know that
they can take the black
vote for granted, so
why even bother pre-
tending that they
would seriously consid-
er black Obama as a
nominee for president
or even vice president?

Recently, in a further
display of their deep-
seated disdain for black
voters, the Democratic
Party chose to stick to
their self-generated
party rules about the
Democratic presiden-
tial primary calendar
and disenfranchise
black voters in Florida.

Black Democrat Rep.
Alcee Hastings is join-
ing in a law suit with
white Democrat
Senator Bill Nelson

against the Democratic
Party to fight for the
right of Florida to hold
its binding primary on
January 29, 2008. The
two Florida Democrat
lawmakers said that
this is an issue of "voter
rights versus political
party rules."

The legal challenge
would most likely be
based on an allegation
that the rights of blacks
were violated by the
Democratic Party
under the 14th
Amendment to the US
Constitution. In the
1963 case of Grey vs.
Sanders, the US
Supreme Court ruled
that separating voters
into different classes
violated the equal pro-
tection clause of the
14th Amendment to
the US Constitution.

Well, so much for the
incessant claim by
Democrats that they
want to "let every vote
count."

Frances Rice is chair-
man of the National
Black Republican

Association and may
be contacted at:
http://www.nbra.info/

The Southern
University and
Alabama State
University Men's
Basketball teams are
heading to Dallas to
join Paul Quinn
College in playing 2
games in the SMU Tip-
Off Classic, November
10-11. Come out and
support SMU as they
spotlight HBCU bas-
ketball in the DFW
Metroplex.

The games are slated
for this weekend at
Moody Colisum on the
SMU campus:

Saturday - Alabama
State vs. Paul Quinn
5:00 PM and SMU vs.
Southern at 7:35 PM.
On Sunday Southern
will play Paul Quinn at
2:00 PM and SMU will
face Alabama State at
4:35 PM.

Southern University
Jaguars have the fol-

lowing gentlemen from
our metroplex:

#25 Steffon Wiley, a
Junior from Carter
High School at the
Guard position. #

55 Barry Honore, a
Freshman from South
Garland High School
plays Forward.

Alabma State
University Hornets
have the following gen-
tlemen from our
metroplex: #30 30 Joel

Bosh, a Senior at
Forward, he is a gradu-
ate of Dallas Lincoln
High. #11 Brandon
Brooks, a Junior at
Guard and graduate
from Euless Trinity in
Dallas.

To purchase your
tickets with the HBCU
family, please call
Bethany Tiffin, SMU
Athletic Ticket Sales,
at 214-768-2376 and
ask for the Southern

Group Sales price.
Your purchase allows
you to see both games
on a given day.

Bring that HBCU
spirit to SMU's cam-
pus. Invite high school
and middle school

youth to come out and
see HBCU basketball
in the DFW
Metroplex. Encourage
HBCU alums to come
out and support 3
HBCUs on SMU's
"The Hardwood".

The Dallas County District Attorney’s Office 
And American Red Cross Team Up

To help community
blood needs, the Dallas
County District
Attorney’s Office will be
kicking off their first
Red Cross Holiday
Blood Drive to help
meet the needs for the
Thanksgiving Holiday.
The employee drive will
be held next Wednesday,
November 14, from
10AM to 4PM.

Statistics show that
someone needs blood
every two seconds in
this country, and so the
need for blood dona-
tions is ongoing. Here in
Texas and across the
United States, accident
victims, cancer and
leukemia patients, and
people needing life-sav-
ing surgeries and trans-

fusions, require an ade-
quate blood supply
every day. Blood dona-
tions for these everyday
needs are especially crit-
ical during the holidays,
because donors are dis-
tracted by holiday activ-
ities and fewer people
give blood.

“As prosecutors our
efforts are not confined
to the four walls of the
courtroom, and there-
fore, I believe we have
an obligation to be
active in the communi-
ty,” said District
Attorney Craig Watkins.
“While our primary
responsibility is to seek
justice in criminal cases
in our jurisdiction, what
better way to help a vic-
tim than by partnering

with the 
American Red Cross

in their efforts, as the
donations collected dur-
ing our office’s blood

drive could ultimately
save the life of someone
who has been the victim
of a violent crime, as
well as those who are
faced with life-threaten-
ing injuries or diseases.”

While blood recipi-
ents may never be able
to personally thank the
person who gave them
blood, they are truly
grateful, says John
Anukem, Director of
Donor Recruitment of
the American Red Cross
Blood Services,
Southwest Region -
Texas.

“We are excited about

the Holiday drive and
our partnership with the
District Attorney’s
Office,” Mr. Anukem
says. “It’s a great honor
to work with District
Attorney Craig Watkins.
“We know this partner-
ship will be making a
positive difference in
our community.
Together, we can help
save a life.”

Donors must be in
general good health,
weigh at least 110
pounds and be at least
17 years of age or older.
Volunteer blood donors
must also show identifi-
cation at registration – a
valid driver’s license
with photo, a Red Cross
donor card or another
form of official picture
identification.

The Shiloh
Missionary Baptist
Church was founded
in 1884 for the “plain
folks”, now through a
strong history
Missionary Baptist
has lasted almost one
and one quarter of a
century. Coming to
the special 123rd
Anniversary Worship
Service on Sunday
November 11, from
8:00 a.m. – 11:00
a.m., is world
renowned gospel
singer Yolanda Adams
and All-American tail-

back Kelvin Bryant.
Together, Adams and
Bryant will help the
community celebrate
its 123rd year fellow-
ship. Come together
and celebrate with
inspirational speakers
Yolanda Adams, and
Kelvin Bryant, at this
year’s anniversary
located right in the
heart of Plano at 920
East 14th Street. For
further information,
please contact Shiloh
Missionary Baptist
Church at 972-423-
6695.

HBCU Basketball Spotlighted at SMU this Weekend

Shiloh Missionary Baptist
Church’s 123rd Anniversary
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THE TRUTH CLINIC
It’s Tough For Offenders To Pay Their Debt To Society

The criminal justice
system in the United
States is broken and
needs to be fixed.
Many of the decisions
made by the courts and
penal institutions may
be legal according to
the law but in reality
are burdensome abom-
inations.

With the possible
exception of China, the
United States currently
imprisons more of its
population than any
other country on earth.
The Bureau of Justice
Statistics reports in
excess of 2,000,000
incarcerated in 2005,
up almost 60 percent
since 1993 and grow-
ing.

How did a nation
dedicated to the princi-
ple of freedom become
the world's leading jail-
er? The answer has lit-
tle to do with crime,
but much to do with
the perception of
crime, and how that
perception has been
manipulated for politi-
cal gain and financial
profit.

The media, especial-
ly television, has a vest-
ed interest in perpetu-
ating the notion that
crime is out of control.
Such saturation cover-
age has a direct impact
on public perceptions
and increases the fear
of being victimized.

As a result, it has
become impossible to
run an election cam-
paign without advocat-
ing more jails, harsher
punishment, and more
executions even though
none of these things
have worked to reduce
crime. In addition to
the politicians, private-
prison companies,
related unions, and
other interests whose
business success

depends on mass incar-
ceration have also capi-
talized on the public’s
fear of crime.

Over the last 20
years, the prison popu-
lation has surged in
every state in the coun-
try. While the nation's
population has grown
by only 20 percent, the
number of Americans
held in local, state, and
federal lockups has
quadrupled. And the
numbers are dispropor-
tionately African
American.

Prisons are not
expanding because
more crimes are being
committed. Since
1993, the national
crime statistics have
fluctuated but have
dropped almost 50 per-
cent. It's not crime
that has grown out of
control; it is the pun-
ishment. Huge num-
bers of prisoners are
now receiving manda-
tory sentences for drug
offenses and other
transgressions that fill
our prisons and con-
sume outlandish sums
of money for construc-
tion and operational
expense.

The American tax-
payer is spending
approximately $60 bil-
lion annually on pris-
ons, an increase of 619
percent since 1982.
For this amount of
money taxpayers might
reasonably expect a
corresponding drop in
crime and safer com-
munities. A recent
study by the University
of Texas estimates that
while the number of
inmates has grown by
more than 300 percent
over the last 30 years
that growth in incarcer-
ation is responsible for
no more than 27 per-
cent of the correspon-

ding drop in crime.
Prisons are certainly
not a cost efficient
crime deterrent.

Convicted felons
have a debt to pay to
society. When a felon is
sentenced, the sentence
usually consists of jail
time, fines and/or resti-
tution, probation time,
and other forms of
p o s t - i n c a r c e r a t i o n
supervision.

In fulfilling the obli-
gations set forth by
society as a prerequisite
for release, the ex-felon
has paid the price for
the transgression com-
mitted against society.
At that time, society
should restore the ex-
felon to full member-
ship, which means with
all of the rights and
benefits to which a citi-
zen is entitled. For the
majority of ex-felons
this is not the case.

The release of ex-
felons back into their
communities with
restricted citizenship
rights makes them a
dependent population.
The felon disenfran-
chisement laws or other
burdensome and oner-
ous restoration restric-
tions placed upon ex-
felons prohibit them
from functioning con-
structively in society
thereby marginalizing
their ability to be pro-
ductive citizens. In
many cases, the only
options available to
those who are ex-felons
are illicit activities that
will only lead to them
being incarcerated
again and again.

Even finding a job is
difficult for a reformed
ex-convict. More and
more employers are
conducting criminal
background checks on
job applicants, which
can make it much more

difficult for the mil-
lions of Americans with
criminal records to find
employment and
become self-supporting
law-abiding members
of society.

Policies that encour-
age employers to adopt
sweeping exclusions
such as not hiring or
considering anyone
with any type of crimi-
nal history locks out
and eliminates many
rehabilitated and quali-
fied individuals from a
source of income. This
places additional finan-
cial burdens on the
resources of the com-
munities they inhabit.

An estimated
600,000 prisoners will
be freed every year for
the next several years
and the unanswered
question is where they
will live and what they
will do?   The current
prison system has a
poor record for rehabil-
itation.

The blanket, rather
than selective, restric-
tions placed on the
majority of ex-felons
are neither deterrents
nor rehabilitative. They
are onerous shackles
placed by a fear driven
vindictive society that
forces those who have
legitimately paid their
debt to society to con-
tinue paying.

For a society that
claims to want offend-
ers to reintegrate into
society the American
system of weighing ex-
convicts down with
insurmountable post-
incarceration physical
and financial restric-
tions seems like a self-
defeating way of
achieving that goal.

James W. Breedlove
Comments or opinions

may be sent to the writer
at: www.truthclinic.com
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Out Of Africa

(GIN) - A summit on
information and com-
munications technology
saw pledges of over $50
billion from private sec-
tor companies seeking
to develop Africa's ICT
sector.

The two day Connect
Africa conference took
place in Kigali, capital
of Rwanda, from Oct.
29-30 and drew over

500 participants,
including government
ministers looking to
substitute economic
growth for foreign aid.

''For the past 50 years
of African independ-
ence we have been talk-
ing about help, assis-
tance, and we did not
go anywhere with that,''
said Hamidoun Touré,
head of the UN

I n t e r n a t i o n a l
Te lecommunicat ion
Union. ''We are well
aware of one thing. No
one will get rich from
handouts and charity.
That is why we are
here: we are saying we
mean business.'' 

Africa has experi-
enced inconsistent
growth in internet
capacity, but the use of

mobile phones has
exploded across the
continent, providing an
invaluable social and
business tool for hun-
dreds of millions of
people.

According to ITU,
there were just 16 mil-
lion cell phone sub-
scribers in 2000, but
this figure had risen to
136 million by 2005.

Investment in cell
phones is expected to
double to $50 billion
over the next five years
to extend coverage to
90 percent of the popu-
lation, including vil-
lages with agriculture-
based economies as
well as the upper and
middle class.

''We are not going to
bridge the digital

divide,'' Anthony Von
See, the Vice President
of Cisco Systems told
the news agency IRIN.
''We are going to
leapfrog over it.'' 

Cisco has set up net-
working academies
across Africa to train
men and women to
work in the sector in an
effort to reverse the so-
called 'brain-drain'.

Billions Pledged to 'Connect Africa'

(GIN) – Libya may
soon receive compensa-
tion for the brutal
deportation of thou-
sands of its countrymen
by Italians during their
occupation of the north
African nation in 1911.
A treaty is on the table
to settle the compensa-
tion question, accord-
ing to the Foreign
Minister of Italy,
Massimo D’Alema.

''We have certain

debts owed to Libya
but we also have a fun-
damental interest in
our links with this
essential partner,''
D’Alema was quoted as
saying.

The treaty would
close ''a sad chapter in
history'', he said at a
recent conference on
the deportations. Every
year Libyans recall the
deportations with a
national day of mourn-

ing, cutting off all
international commu-
nications and suspend-
ing bus services,
planes, trains, post and
telephone networks.

The compensation
deal will remove any
roadblocks to a 28-bil-
lion dollar investment
by Italian energy giant
Eni said to develop oil
and natural gas pro-
duction for a period of
10 years.

(GIN) – A South
African golfing tourna-
ment lost its rights to
the name ''Nelson
Mandela'' after deal-
ings by its co-host,
Gary Player, with the
brutal regime of
Burma came to light.

The board of
trustees of the Nelson
Mandela Children’s

Fund voted to with-
draw its endorsement
of the event to protect
Mandela’s image.

The controversy
broke out when
Archbishop Emeritus
Desmond Tutu blasted
Player over his ties
with Burma, where he
built the Pun Hlaing
golf course in 2002.

Many well-known
Americans have played
at the Nelson Mandela
Invitational Golf
Tournament including
Denzel Washington.
Cheech Marin of
Cheech and Chong is
expected to play this
year. The tournament
takes place in Western
Cape, Nov. 23.

Libya to Receive Reparations from Italy Major Golfers' Event
Stripped of Mandela's Name
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Dallas businesswoman
Lynn Flint Shaw has been
elected chair of the
DART Board of
Directors. Shaw, who has
served on the board since
2003, succeeds chairman
Mark Enoch of Rowlett.
Shaw is owner of Lynn
Flint Shaw,
M.C.D./C.C.C. &
Associates. Board mem-
bers also elected Randall
Chrisman vice chair,
Robert W. Strauss secre-
tary and John Danish
assistant secretary.
Officers serve one-year
terms.A recognized
expert in the field of
speech language patholo-
gy and therapy, Lynn
Flint Shaw has also built a
reputation as one of
Dallas' most tireless and
effective arts patrons.

After working for the
University of Texas at
Dallas/Callier Center for
C o m m u n i c a t i o n
Disorders as a Speech-
Language Pathologist, In
1979, Shaw founded
Lynn Flint Shaw,
M.C.D/C.C.C. and
Associates, a company

that supervises speech
pathologists, physical
therapists and occupa-
tional therapists in private
practice; diagnoses and
treats patients; and con-
ducts continuing educa-
tion seminars and
research. Over the years
her expertise has led her
to testify before the
Senate and House

Subcommittee on
Preschool Education.

Shaw has been an
active patron of the arts in
the Dallas community.
She has served as a char-
ter member of the Board
of Directors for the Dallas
Center for the Performing
Arts Foundation; as a
board member of the

Shakespeare Festival of
Dallas, the Arts District
Friends, Dallas Junior
Players and Dallas
Coalition for the Arts.
Shaw served as chair of
the 2003 Bond Campaign
Strategic Advisory
Committee which led to
the passage of a $30 mil-
lion bond package in sup-
port of Dallas' cultural
institutions.During her
tenure on the Dallas
Symphony Association's
board of governors and
executive board, Shaw
began the Dallas
Symphony Orchestra's
African American and
Hispanic Festival con-
certs. These free concerts
highlighting the groups'
contributions in sym-
phonic music. A graduate
of Xavier University, she
earned a Masters of
C o m m u n i c a t i o n
Disorders from Louisiana
State Univ. Medical
Center, Shaw has
received numerous pro-
fessional awards and
recognition. She is mar-
ried to Rufus Shaw and
has one son, Ian

Gwendolyn D.
Skillern, CPA, is
President and CEO of
the National Association
of Black Accountants,
Inc.'s (NABA) National
Board of Directors. She
was inducted in 2006,
and has chosen "NABA:
Power, Passion,
Possibilities," as her
leadership motto.
Skillern, a National
Director for three years,
was previously a Western
Region Vice President;
President, Vice
President, and Secretary
of the San Francisco
Chapter; and has
chaired several chapter
committees. She is a
recipient of the National
Outstanding Member
Award, as well as the
San Francisco Chapter's
Outstanding Member
and Distinguished
Service awards.

Skillern is a Senior
Vice President and
General Auditor for
CareFirst BlueCross
BlueShield in Maryland,

where she is responsible
for directing internal
audit services, quality
control activities, and
special investigations for
its essential operations.
Before joining
CareFirst, Skillern
served as a Vice
President and as the
Controller and a Vice

President of Internal
Audit for Bass Hotels &
Resorts. Earlier, she was
Director of Internal
Audit for the
Northwestern hub of
Kaiser Foundation
Health Plan, Inc., and
an Accountant at

Deloitte, Haskins, &
Sells.

In her role as NABA
president, Skillern's
goals include enhancing
and expanding core pro-
grams such as the orga-
nization's Financial
Literacy Program, and
increasing membership
to include the growing
number of African
American Certified
Public Accountants
(CPA)s. Skillern is also
going to focus on
expanding NABA's
domestic and global
influences through
strategic alliances with
its corporate partners,
the American Institute
of CPAs and the
Association for the
Advancements for Black
Accountants in South
Africa.

Skillern holds a
Bachelor of Science
degree from the
University of California
at Berkeley and an MBA
from Stanford
University.

People in the News

Lynn Flint Shaw Katrina Keyes
The president of

President of K Strategies
Group LLC. Ms. Keyes is
an accomplished business
and community leader
with over 15 years of expe-
rience in the areas of
M/WBE programs, public
affairs and procurement. K
Strategies Group LLC is a
premier public affairs firm
in North Texas providing
M/WBE programs, public
information programs and
community relations with
an expertise in the con-
struction industry. K
Strategies assist clients in
maximizing the utilization
of minority, women and
small businesses and in
developing effective public
relations and community
relations programs.

The firm provides serv-
ices to an array of clients on
major projects, including
the Dallas Cowboys

Stadium, Dallas
Mercantile Block, Texas
A&M University System
and Texas Department of
Transportation.

Ms. Keyes is a commit-
ted servant leaders working
with many chambers of
commerce and serving on
the board of directors of
the Trinity River Authority
and the Dallas Black
Chamber of Commerce.
She has received numerous
honors for her business
accomplishments includ-
ing being ranked as one of
the “Top 40 Under 40”
business leader from the
Dallas Business Journal,
Corporate Advocate of the
Year Award by the
Dallas/Fort Worth
Minority Business
Council, Outstanding
Woman in Construction by
the Fort Worth Business &
Professional Women, and

Regional Director’s
Awards by the U.S.
Department of Commerce
Minority Business

Development Agency.
Ms. Keyes is a strong

advocate for minority busi-
ness because she believes
entrepreneurship is the key
to opportunities, economic
development and building
wealth in minority commu-
nities.

Gwendolyn D. Skillern, CPA 
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The city of Irving
Mayor’s Human
Relations Advisory
Council in partnership
with the Greater Irving –
Las Colinas Chamber of
Commerce is hosting a
resourceful, informational
forum on “Immigration

The New Beginning
Center and the North
Garland Baptist
Fellowship will unite
next Saturday
November 17, with
families rallying against
abuse. Young men
against abuse must
gather on Saturday at
the North Garland
Baptist Fellowship
Church at 5840 North
Garland Ave. Garland,
Texas 75044 from 8:30
a.m. – 12:30 p.m.
Keynote speakers of the
event include an E.R.
doctor, a Resource
Police Officer, a Court
Judge, the #10
Trendsetter, someone

from the Mexican con-
sulate, and Director of
Non-Residential at
New Beginning.
Admission to this rally
is free, and refresh-
ments will be served.

For any further infor-
mation or to R.S.V.P.
contact Selmore Haines
at 972-414-1494, or by
email at shaines@veri-
zon.net. Please R.S.V.P.
by November 13, 2007.

The NAACP Youth
and College Division
and The Princeton
Review Foundation
proudly present the
11th annual National
Day of College
Preparation; a free
half-day of college
preparation skills and
financial aid informa-
tion for high school
students and parents
coordinated by 10
NAACP Youth
Councils and College
Chapters across the
country.

The National Day of
College Preparation
will be held from 8:00
am to 2:00 pm on
Saturday, November
10th at Texas A& M
University -Commerce
Mesquite Metroplex
Center, 2600 Motley
Drive Mesquite, TX
75150. There is no fee
to attend, but online
registration is required.
The Princeton Review

Foundation will offer a
workshop on SAT
score improvement
strategies, and then
give an SAT practice
test (math and critical
reading sections) to
students who register
and attend. The SAT's
essay and writing sec-
tions will NOT be
included in this prac-
tice test due to time
constraints.

Princeton Review
test preparation books,
donated by Random
House, will be given to
the first 70 registered
students who attend at
each site. In Kansas
City only, the practice
test, workshop and
books will be ACT
instead of SAT.

The NAACP will
facilitate “Paying for
College” workshops for
parents, which will
take place from about
10 AM to noon. These
workshops will explain

the benefits of continu-
ing an education
beyond high school
and discuss the various
types of financial aid
resources available to
help families prepare
for the college admis-
sions process. The
NAACP will provide
students with a light
breakfast and lunch at
all locations.

For additional infor-
mation, please contact
Alethea Bonello, Youth
and College Division
at 1-410-580-5657 or
by email at, a_bonel-
lo@yahoo.com. Be
sure and visit
http://events.embark.c
om/event/naacp/ to
register! For even fur-
ther information, call
Dr. Joyce Miller, 972-
882-7527 or contact
her by email at,
joyce_mil ler@tamu-
commerce.edu. Space
is limited so register
today! 

11th Annual National 
Day of College Preparation Issues in Irving” called

Train the Trainer next
Monday, November 12
from 7:00 p.m. – 9:00
p.m. at The Irving Arts
Center, Suite 200. This
forum is particularly
designed for leaders in
social service, education,

and religious agencies, as
well as managers and
human resource represen-
tatives of local businesses.
Be sure to R.S.V.P. by
Friday November 9 to
kheinzen@irvingcham-
ber.com, or call 214-217-
8484.

Train the Trainer

Men and Young Adult Males Against Abuse Rally
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The Texas Black Sports Hall Of Fame
Honors Athletes And Coaches

DALLAS, TX---
The Texas Black
Sports Hall of Fame
Class of 2007 eleven
newest inductees are
an elite class of histo-
ry making athletes
and coaches: former
Dallas Cowboy and
SuperBowler Thomas
“ H o l l y w o o d ”
Henderson; former
Dallas Cowboy,
SuperBowl co-MVP,
and Dallas South Oak
Cliff H.S. standout
Harvey Martin
(posthumously); for-
mer Dallas Cowboy
and Four-time Pro-
Bowler Calvin Hill;
former Dallas
Maverick all-time
franchise assist leader
Derek Harper; NBA

C h a m p i o n s h i p
Detroit Piston, Baylor
University All-
American, and Dallas
Carter H.S. standout
Micheal Williams;
NCAA University of
A r k a n s a s
Championship Coach
Nolan Richardson;
former Arizona
Cardinal and Pro-
Bowler Larry
Centers; University of
Texas standout,
College Football Hall
of Famer, and former
NFL Indianapolis
Colt & Buffalo Bill
Roosevelt Leaks;
NCAA Prairie View
A&M University
Track star, current
Lancaster ISD Coach,
Beverly Humphrey;

NCAA Southern
University Swimming
Record-holder Dr.
Thurmin Robins; and
the inaugural “Rube
Foster” award recipi-
ent (presented to a
n o n - A f r i c a n -
American for
unselfish dedication
and contributions to
the success of those in
Black sports history)
former Dallas Carter
H.S. Coach and
DISD Athletic
Director, Kedric
Couch.

The 12th Texas
Black Sports Hall of
Fame Banquet and
Auction will be held
Saturday, December
1, 2007 at 7 p.m. at
the Hilton Anatole

Hotel, 2201
Stemmons Freeway in
Dallas, Texas. From
noon – 2p.m. the day
of the Banquet, the
African American
Museum presents A
Family Day and
Sports Clinic, featur-
ing current and for-
mer inductees.
Children and their
families meet the ath-
letes, and can secure
photos and auto-
graphs. In addition to
the public recognition
of these sports figures
at the annual
Banquet, the Hall of
Fame’s objectives are
to collect and pre-
serve objects docu-
menting the history of
the Texas African-

American athlete, cre-
ate a permanent exhi-
bition on the subject,
and to develop educa-
tional programs that
benefit both children
and adults. Proceeds
from the Banquet and
Auction benefit the
education programs
and exhibitions of the
African American
Museum.

The Texas Black
Sports Hall of Fame
(TBSHOF), housed
at the African
American Museum,
was established to
chronicle the sports
history contributions
made by African
Americans. It was
established in 1996 to
honor coaches and

athletes of high char-
acter and athletic
achievement, who are
either Texans by birth
or by athletic partici-
pation (collegiate or
professional), and
who have made recog-
nizable contributions
to African American
culture and/or history.
The general public
submits the nomi-
nees, and a panel of
judges (including
sports/media journal-
ist) makes the final
selection.

For more informa-
tion call 14.565.9026
x313 or visit
www.aamdal las.org
(click the Texas Black
Sports Hall of Fame
link).



Ongoing
African American

Republican Club of
Collin County meets
4th Tuesday of every
month at 7:00pm,
Collin County
Republican Party
Headquarters. For
more info, please call
Fred Moses at 972
618 7027 or email him
at fred@tes.com.

A R T H E L L O
BECK GALLERY a
3-year retrospective of
the innovative photog-
raphy & video pro-
gram SIGHTS &
SOUNDS. Sponsored
by PRESERVATION
Link, Inc, a non-profit
organization dedicated
to bringing visual liter-
acy to South Dallas
students.. The event
will be ongoing
through December
31st from 12 noon –
8pm Tuesdays –
Fridays, and 10am to
4 pm on Saturdays at
the South Dallas
Cultural Center 3400
S Fitzhugh Avenue.
FREE admission. For
more information,
please contact Vicki
Meek at 214-670-
0315, or by email at
victoria.meek@dal-
lascityhall.com.

The Collin County
Black Chamber of
Commerce Monthly
Lunch & Learn a great
opportunity to meet
other business owners,
as well as key decision
makers from various
organizations around
the metroplex. Join us
every third Thursday
to gain valuable infor-
mation presented by
featured guest speak-
ers to help your busi-
ness grow. $15 for
members; $20 for
n o n - m e m b e r s ,
11 :00am-1 :00pm,
Ralph and Kacoos -
401 S. Central Expy,
Allen. For general
information and reser-
vations call 469-424-
0120.

November 8
The 7th Annual

South Dallas Dance
Festival kicks off with
a roundtable discus-
sion on the relevance

Denton. The perform-
ance begins at 8:00
p.m. and is FREE.
Please call 940-565-
2791 for further infor-
mation.

JAMMIN' AT THE
CENTER continues to
be the best jazz jam in
North Texas featuring
Shelly Carrol, Allan
Green and Jonathon
Fisher. Come hear the
coolest jazz in our new
cool space! All jazz
musicians are welcome
to sit-in; just bring your
instrument of choice.
It's always alcohol free,
smoke free, and chat-
ter-free! Come to the
South Dallas Cultural
Center 3400 S
Fitzhugh Ave and enjoy
Jammin’ at the center
from 12 midnight-3
am. Admission to this
event is FREE. For fur-
ther information, please
contact Vicki Meek at
214/670-0315, or by
email at
victoria.meek@dallasc-
ityhall.com.

November 17
Urban League of

Greater Dallas Young
Professionals MICA
Conference “Impacting
the Bottom Line”, fea-
tures keynote speaker,
Donna Deberry, Vice
President of Diversity
at NIKE will be held at
Texas Instruments
Forest Lane Facility
12500 TI Boulevard
Dallas, TX from 9:00
a.m. to 4:30 p.m. The
MICA Conference tar-
gets professionals
between the ages of 21
and 40 and prepares to
deliver focused educa-
tion within the issues,
trends, and concerns in
the corporate arena.
For more information,
visit www.ulgdyp.org.

Dallas West Indies
Awards Dinner and
Dance at 6 pm $35 and
Children's Chorus and
Youth String Orchestra
Debut Concert at 7:30
pm $10 both at The
Dallas Black Academy
of Arts and Letters,
Dallas Convention
Center Theatre
Complex For tickets or
additional information
call 214-943-2442

further information,
please email
cvchc@dcccd.edu, or
call 972-860-7800.

November 10
“Jazzing it Up with

Awakening” Awakening
Furniture’s Launch
Celebration

Come join us for an
evening of FUN and
FURNITURE! 6 – 10
pm Stephanie Ward
Gallery 920 18th St
Plano, TX 75074
Cocktail Attire Furniture
Exhibits LIVE Auctions
Hors d'oeuvres Door
Prizes Jazz Band RSVP
at (214) 432-7936 or
rsvp@awakeningfurni-
ture.com

FREE HUD-approved
Homebuyer Education
Classes hosted by the
City of Lewisville’s First
Time Homebuyer
Program, HUD-
approved, free, and open
to the public. The entire
home buying process,
including getting the
loan that's right for your
household budget, shop-
ping for your dream
home, dealing with cred-
it issues, and how to
insure and inspect your
new home. Also learn
how you could qualify
for up to $19,000
through the City of
Lewisville Homebuyer
Assistance Program.
Professionals from all
industries are present to
answer questions. All stu-
dents receive free HUD-
approved certificates of
completion and lunch.
Full day attendance is
required. The seminar is
located at 400 High
School Dr. in Lewisville
and lasts from 8:30 am -
4:30 pm. For more infor-
mation call 972-219-
5026, or email arin
con@cityoflewisville.co
m.

Songs of South Africa
is a free presentation
located at the Audelia
Road Branch Library,
10045 Audelia Road at
2:00 p.m. Admission to
this event is FREE, call
214-670-1350 with any
questions.

African Drumming
with Leo Hassan at the
North Oak Cliff Branch
Library, 302 West Tenth

Street. The fun begins at
2:30 pm, and is open to
the public. Admission is
FREE, for more infor-
mation call 214-670-
7555.

November 11
Black Man's Film

Festival: The Radical
Legacy of Malcolm X
Featuring Revolutionary
Poetry, Films, and the
Malcolm X Knowledge
Bowl; located at the
Magnolia Lounge in Fair
Park, South Dallas,
75210 starting at 8:00
p.m. Admission is $5.00,
for further information
please call 214-426-
1683.

November 13
Plano Chamber of

Commerce Excellence in
Business Luncheon
Series 11:30am to
1:00pm Featuring the
"State of the Community
Address" with Mayor Pat
Evans, City of Plano; Dr.
Doug Otto,
Superintendent PISD;
Dr. Cary Israel, Collin
County Community
College District and the
City of Plano’s 2007
Environmental Star of
Excellence Awards.
Individual Tickets: $31
for Members or $40 for
non-members; Tables of
eight: $300 for members
or $375 for non-mem-
bers For reservations or
more information con-
tact the Plano Chamber
of Commerce at 972-
424-7547 or
www.planochamber.org

November 13-14
Scholarships Available

for Grant Writing
Workshop in Dallas.
Partial scholarships in
the amount of $74.00 are
available for nonprofit
and faith based organiza-
tions, government agen-
cies, and schools.
Students are to attend a
two-day grant-writing
workshop presented by
Zocklein and Associates
from 8.30 am to 5 pm.
The presentation is being
held at the Holiday Inn
Select, 10650 North
Central Expressway,
Dallas Texas. To register
call Zocklein and
Associates at 800 371
5703 or visit the website
at www.zockgrant.com.

November 14 
Love & Logic presents:

Preventing Disruptive
Behavior & Teaching
R e s p o n s i b i l i t y
Techniques for avoiding
battles over schoolwork
and homework, how to
motivate underachieving
and apathetic kids. How
to help children be come
self-motivated and
proud. 8am to 3pm
Admission is $99, for
more information con-
tact Love & Logic at
800.338.4065 or visit
www.loveandlogic.com

November 15
Estate Planning

Seminar free 90-minute
program 10:00am and
7:00pm, Discover how
easy it is to use a Living
Trust or a Properly
Drafted Will to save on
Estate Taxes and Control
your Assets. This educa-
tional program will be
presented by Dallas
Estate Planning
Attorney, Richard P.
Johnson, Board Certified
in Estate Planning and
Probate  Law by the
Texas Board of Legal
S p e c i a l i z a t i o n .
Admissions is FREE

For reservations call:
Karen at (972) 497-1010
Karen@RichardJohnson
Law.com

Songs of South Africa
performed at the Walnut
Hill Branch Library,
9495 Marsh Lane. The
performance begins at
4:00 pm; admission to
this event is FREE. For
further information,
please call 214-670-
6376.

November 16
Jazz Friday Join us for

this amazing evening of
live Jazz from 7:30-9:30
p.m. Stephanie Ward
Gallery 920 18th St.
Plano, TX  75074 The
best in local Jazz and
excellent fool catered by
the Parlour Cafe and Bar
in Richardson Tickets or
additional information
call 469 229-0024 $20
in advance and $25 at
the door.

African Percussion
Ensemble featuring
director Gideon
Alorwoyie, at the
Concert Hall, UNT
Music Building in

Proud To Be An Active
Partner In The Community

Sponsored By:
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Community Calendar
of Black Dance in Dallas
and the US. Guest artist,
Gary de Matas from
Trinidad-Tobago will be
on hand to add the Afro-
Caribbean perspective.
All dancers and dance
lovers are encouraged to
come out and participate
in the discussion at the
South Dallas Cultural
Center 3400 S Fitzhugh
Ave. starting at 6:00 p.m.
Admission to this event
is FREE. For further
information, please con-
tact Vicki Meek at
214/670-0315, or by
email at
victoria.meek@dallasci-
tyhall.com.

November 9
Fort Worth

Community Drum
Circle this recreational
music-making experi-
ence is open to everyone.
No experience needed! If
you have a drum or per-
cussion instrument,
bring it, if not, there will
be instruments on hand
for anyone to use. The
Drum Circle is located at
Mind Body Spirit
Center, 5521 Bellaire
Drive South in Fort
Worth from 7:00 p.m. –
8:00 p.m. Admission to
this event is FREE. For
more info email sjan-
hughes@aol.com.

Live Music Sounds of
Brazil band to be per-
formed at the Brazil
Brasileiro Cafe, 518 W.
Arapaho in Richardson,
75080. This event is free
and open to the public.
The live music perform-
ance begins at 8:00 p.m.

The DFW African
American Professionals
Conference the 2nd
Annual DFW African
American Professionals
Conference and
Reception is to promote
the importance of pro-
fessional development
for African American
and provide opportuni-
ties for personal growth
and community net-
working. The conference
will be located at the
Hilton Garden Inn, 800
North Main Street in
Duncanville Cedar Valley
and Tarrant County –
South from 8:30a.m. –
4:00p.m. Admission to
this event is $159. For
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Cover Story

Douglass Community Center
Girl  Talk 2007 Cotil l ion

The Girl Talk
Organization was
founded by Dianne
Dillon in July 2001
for young ladies ages
9-17 to enr ich the
lives of those within
the Douglass

Community Center
community. This
community is pre-
dominately Afr ican
American with the
highest Plano popu-
lation of youth at
r isk. The program

develops social l ife
skills through educa-
tional and leisure
activities and has had
a major impact on the
lives of the partici-
pants.

Girl Talk provides

youth and teens with
the oppor tunity to
learn and explore
things about them-
selves, their peers,
and the community.
They learn how to
face and overcome

challenges, set and
achieve goals.

The Girl Talk 2007
Cotill ion was held
recently where the
twelve members of
the 2007 class were
presented. The ele-

gant affair included
dinner and dancing,
with the night closed
with words of
encouragement to the
ladies as they go for-
ward in their various
endeavors.

Community Spotlight:
The Junior Debutantes

Girls throughout
the Douglass commu-
nity, ages 9 – 17 are
offered the opportuni-
ty to join Plano’s Girl
Talk organization.
The members partici-
pate in community
projects, as well as
various workshops to
help develop life and
career skills. Girl Talk
annually features the
Debutantes, and the
Junior Debutantes.
The Debutantes are
role models and

exemplary young
ladies in the commu-
nity. The Junior
Debutantes of the
2007 Cotillion Ball
were Tianna Revely,
Imani Cofield, Joi
McRoberts, Jakayla
Lofton, and Bryanna
S t a n d b e r r y .
C o n g r a t u l a t i o n s
ladies on your accom-
plishments in your
early lives, and contin-
ue to grow in strength
through achieving
your goals.
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Arts & Entertainment

Stephanie Ward Gallery
920 18th Street • Plano, TX 75074

469-229-0024
Join us for the smooth Jazz sounds at our next Jazz Friday.

Ticket prices $20 in advance and $25 at the door.

Hot food and wine included in the price.

Come relax browse in the gallery and mix

and mingle with out jazz and art lovers.

Jazz Friday
Nov. 16th

2007
7:30 - 9:30 p.m.

(Food Served)

Every 3rd Friday Of The Month

Dance Fusion 2007 Features West Coast
Company, Local Favorites

Let Music Fill the Air at...

Nationally-renowned
Janice Garrett and
Dancers, a San
Francisco company, will
be special performers at
Dance Fusion 2007 at
Collin College. Dance
Fusion 2007 will also
feature the Collin Dance
E n s e m b l e ,
Elledanceworks Dance
Company and Muscle
Memory Dance
Theatre. Performances
will be at 8 p.m., Friday,
Nov. 9 and 2 p.m. and 8
p.m., Saturday, Nov. 10,
at the John Anthony
Theatre, 2800 E. Spring
Creek Parkway in Plano.

Janice Garrett had
more than 20 years of
experience as a dance
artist and choreographer
when she started Janice
Garrett & Dancers in
2002 in the San
Francisco Bay area. The
company has performed
throughout the Bay
Area, Los Angeles, as
well as having complet-
ed three tours to the

Midwest. The company
was honored in January
2004 as one of Dance
Magazine’s “Twenty
Five to Watch.” Janice
Garrett & Dancers will
perform “Brink,” “Fat
Brass,” and the
“Archimedes’ Revenge.”

The Collin Dance
Ensemble, the resident
performing company for
Collin College, under
the direction of Tiffanee
Arnold, tours through-
out the Dallas/Fort
Worth area performing
in local concerts and fes-
tivals such as The Dallas
Dance Festival,The Fort
Worth Dance Festival:
Up and Running,
Dances at a Gathering at
the Eisemann Center,
The University of Texas
at Dallas, Allen Dance
Festival and Dallas’
Dance for the Planet.
The dance company
attends and performs at
the American College
Dance Festival annually
and has been selected

for the Gala
Performance at that fes-
tival five times. Former
residencies include
Battleworks Dance
Company from New
York, Pilobolus Too of
the Pilobolus Dance
Theatre, Eisenhower
Dance Ensemble from
M i c h i g a n ,
Elledanceworks Dance
Company from Dallas
and Taylor 2 of Paul
Taylor Dance Company.
Dance auditions for
Collin Dance Ensemble
are held prior to the fall
semester. The Collin
Dance Ensemble will
perform “Conspirae”
and a work choreo-
graphed by Janice
Garrett.

Tickets for Dance
Fusion 2007 are $8 gen-
eral admission and $5
for senior citizens and
students. All tickets will
be solid at the door. For
more information about
Dance Fusion 2007, call
972.881.5107.

The debut concert
of The Black
Academy Of Arts
And Letters
Children's Chorus
and Youth Str ing
Orchestra will fea-
ture some of the
most talented and
promising youth siz-
zle and soar in this
debut concer t per-
forming a wide range

of music from classi-
cal to pop, Broadway
show tunes, jazz,
blues, hip-hop and
gospel. Chorus
directed by Richard
Odom, Oscar
Williams, and
Carolyn Donnell.
Orchestra conducted
by Greg Primus and
Marzetta Alexander.
The event is hosted
by Board Member
Annette Williams and
the cost of admission
is $10.

The Chorus and
Orchestra will per-
form on Saturday,
November 17, 2007 -
7:30 P.M on the
Naomi Bruton Main
Stage located at the
Dallas Convention
Center Theatre
Complex (Corner of
Canton and Akard
Streets).

You can pay for
your ticket by phone

with a credit card
(Visa, MasterCard,
Discover, and
American Express)
by calling TBAAL
Box Office at (214)
743-2400. If you pay
by phone, your tick-
et(s) can be held for
you at our Will Call
Window. Also, you
can purchase your
ticket(s) at TBAAL's

Box Office between
the hours of 10 a.m.-
5 p.m., Monday-
Friday or Saturdays
Noon-4p.m. The
Box Office is closed
every Tuesday from
11 a.m. - 1 p.m. for
weekly staff meeting.
Cash only is accept-
ed at the box office
on the night of pro-
grams.
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P A R T I E S

BUSINESS OPPORTUNITY

Hiram McBeth III
Attorney and Counselor at Law

(972) 498-8872
No Charge for Consultation

CIVIL LITIGATION    CLASS ACTIONS
• Avandia (Type 2 Diabetes)
• Peanut Butter Contamination

(Code 2111 Peter Pan or Great Value)
• West Dallas Asbestos Exposure
• Personal Injury, Auto Accidents,

Defective Products, Workplace Injuries
• Corporations (Minority/DBE)

Se Habla Español
Not Certified By The Texas Board of Legal Specialization

F I N A N C I A L S E R V I C E S

H A I R S A L O N

More than 25 years of Experience
Call Today for Appointment 214-618-8180

8604 Preston Rd., Suite 119 • Plano, Texas 75024
(Preston Village Shopping Center)

The Styling Salon
It’s All About You and Your Family

Now Hiring Hair Stylists & Barbers

• Retouch Relaxer  . . . . . . . . . . . .$55 (Reg. $65)

• Full Highlights, Cut and Style . . .$95 (Reg. $140)

• Shampoo and Style  . . . . . . . . . .$35 (Reg. $45)

• Swedish Massage (30 Minutes) . . .$30 (Reg. $40)

• Basic Manicure and Pedicure  . . .$35 (Reg. $40)

• Wednesday’s Special  . . .Men’s $12 • Boy’s $10 

FREE Eyebrow Waxing
(with full hair service)

Are you looking for  a lucrative 
business model that really works??

SERIOUS???

1.800.685.74801.800.685.7480

Tired of the MLM
broken promises?

ACCOUNTING

A T T O R N E Y

FIVE STAR ACCOUNTING SERVICES
Consulting * Tax Service * Accounting

TAX PLANNING & PREPARATION FOR:

Sole Proprietors, Partnerships, Corporations and Churches

Over 27 years of Accounting Experience!

Let Us...

*Eliminate the stress of YOU preparing and filing your taxes;

*Plan your year-round tax strategy and record keeping system;

*Consult on maximizing deductions and reducing your tax liability;

*Set up your internal control and compliance systems;

*Simplify your record keeping with software & back-up

Support; and

*Increase your earnings, savings and Profits!

Call Us Today @ 972-841-4616

Rosemary Owens, President/CEO

1210 Drexel Drive  -  Plano, TX 75075

Tel:  972-841-4616    Fax:  972-423-8205

rosemary_owens@hotmail.com

Business Service Directory

Dallas Center for the Performing Arts
Names K Strategies Group as MWBE Consultant

Comptroller Susan Combs
Introduces Taxpayers to the 
Revised Texas Franchise Tax

AUSTIN — The state
Comptroller’s office will
host 10 free seminars
throughout the state to
introduce taxpayers to
the revised Texas fran-
chise tax and help them
learn how to calculate the
tax. The seminars will
benefit current franchise
taxpayers and the
approximately 200,000
new entities that will file
franchise tax reports for
the first time, beginning
with reports due on or
after Jan. 1, 2008.
Unfortunately none are
scheduled for the North
Texas area, but web-
based training is avail-
able.

“The revised franchise
tax, sometimes called the
‘margin tax,’ was passed
by the Legislature in
2006 and modified earli-
er this year,” Comptroller
Susan Combs said.
“After so much public
discussion and debate,
some taxpayers may be
uncertain about exactly
how the law will work.
These free seminars are a
great opportunity to
answer taxpayers’ ques-
tions.”

Web-based training
may also take place to
assist taxpayers unable to
attend a seminar. For
complete details about

the scheduled seminars
and any additional semi-
nars or Web-based train-
ing that may be added to
the schedule, see the
Comptroller’s web site at
www.window.state.tx.us/t
axinfo/franchise/tour.htm

The Comptroller’s free
franchise tax seminars
may be applied to contin-
uing professional educa-
tion requirements for
certified public account-
ants and continuing legal
education for attorneys.

The Legislature
revised the franchise tax
by changing the tax base
and the tax rate and
extending coverage to
most legal entities. All
taxable entities with total
revenue greater than $10
million must pay tax on
their margin. Margin is
the lesser of: total rev-
enue minus cost of goods
sold, total revenue minus
compensation or total
revenue times 70 per-
cent. Total revenue is
determined based on
federal income tax
reporting. Taxable enti-
ties with $10 million or
less in total revenue may
choose an E-Z filing
option (i.e., 0.00575 x
apportioned total rev-
enue), or they may
choose to pay tax on their
margin.

thrilled to have an opportu-
nity to be a part of this
project, and to help

MWBE firms have a
greater role in the construc-
tion of this historic project.”

DALLAS – The Dallas
Center for the Performing
Arts announced today that
it has hired K Strategies to
serve as its Minority and
Women Owned Enterprise
(MWBE) consultant.
Under the leadership of
president Katrina Keyes, K
Strategies will aim to
increase participation of
minority-and women-
owned businesses in the
construction of the Dallas
Center for the Performing
Arts.The $275 million arts
and entertainment center,
which includes four per-
formance venues, a park
and an underground park-
ing garage, is currently
under construction and will
open in the Dallas Arts
District in fall 2009.

Construction of two of
the Center’s signature ven-
ues, the Margot and Bill
Winspear Opera House
and Dee and Charles Wyly
Theatre, as well as the
underground parking
garage, began last year. Of
the $275 million budget for

design and construction of
the Center, only $18 mil-
lion, or less than 7%, will be
funded with public funds.
The Center has been con-
sistently working to reach
its MWBE participation
goals as established by the
City of Dallas.

Several minority- and
women-owned businesses
already have important
contracts in the construc-
tion of the Dallas Center
for the Performing Arts,
including LopezGarcia
Group, Gentzler Electrical
Services, Inc.,Tomas Reyes
Trucking and Tin Man
Enterprises.

“We have been commit-
ted to MWBE participation
in this project from the ear-
liest days of construction,”
said Doug Curtis, vice pres-
ident of design and con-
struction for the Dallas
Center for the Performing
Arts. “While we have
awarded a number of con-
tracts to minority- and
women-owned businesses,
we want to increase those

numbers.We are impressed
with Keyes’ record in
directing MWBE pro-
grams, and we feel that her
firm is the right resource to
help us reach our MWBE
goals.”

Katrina Keyes has more
than 15 years of experience
in the areas of MWBE pro-
grams, public affairs and
procurement. She is presi-
dent of K Strategies Group
LLC, a public affairs firm
specializing in M/WBE
programs, public informa-
tion programs and commu-
nity relations for major con-
struction and development
projects. Major projects
include: the new Dallas
Cowboys Stadium, City of
Dallas Mercantile Block
project, Texas A&M
University System and
Texas Department of
Transportation. Keyes is
also involved in numerous
civic organizations and has
been recognized with sever-
al awards for her work,
including “Small Business
of the Year Award” by the

Dallas Black Chamber of
Commerce and “Advocate
of the Year Award” by the
Dallas/Fort Worth Minority
Business Council.

As MWBE consultant
for the Dallas Center for
the Performing Arts, K
Strategies Group will work
closely with the design and
construction team at the
Dallas Center for the
Performing Arts, as well as
with the two general con-
tractors constructing the
new venues, Linbeck and
McCarthy, to raise aware-
ness of the project among
minority- and women-
owned businesses. K
Strategies Group will also
represent the project at
trade fairs and will report to
the City of Dallas on
MWBE participation in the
project.

“I have been watching
the progress of the Dallas
Center for the Performing
Arts with great interest,”
said Keyes. “The Center
will have a great impact on
our community, and I am
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N2NE (In Tune) Youth Mentoring and
Intervention/Prevention Program

“Focus on your future and believe in your dreams.”
Upcoming sessions
11/05 - Registration
11/07 – Peer Pressure
11/12 – Life Skills
** Thanksgiving
Break**
11/26 – Teen
P r e g n a n c y / S e l f
Preservation
1128 – STD’s and HIV
Awareness

12/03 – Family Values
12/05 – No meeting
12/10 – Establishing Goals & Mission Statements
12/12 – Open Forum (Group Activity)
12/17 – Christmas Party
** Christmas & New Years Break**

N2NE would like to thank the “Gazette” for choosing our pro-
gram as a “Cover Story”. We would also like to thank our church
family “Fellowship Baptist Church of Allen, Pastor W. L. Stafford,
Sr., & First Lady Tasha for their support.” God Bless – Rich Etta
Weathersbee, Cordell Weathersbee, and Penny Francis

The mentoring program is held on Monday’s and Wednesday’s,
from 6:30 – 7:45 pm, in the clubhouse at Indigo on Forest
Apartments, 9669 Forest Lane, Dallas TX 75243

For more information, please call: Rich Etta Weathersbee -
469-223-5618; or Penny Francis - 214-793-7178.

NORTH TEXAS TOLLWAY AUTHORITY
PUBLIC ADVERTISEMENT

The North Texas Tollway Authority (NTTA) will receive sealed

bids at 5900 W. Plano Pkwy. Suite 100, Plano, TX 75093,

(214) 461-2061, until Friday, November 16, 2007 at 10:00 am

for the following projects: 

Project 02320-SH121-00-CN-PM.  Provide and deliver new

fabricated steel for ramp plaza gantries for future NTTA proj-

ects on State Highway 121 (Collin and Denton Counties).

Approximate quantities include 368,000 pounds of structural

steel.  

Project 02325-SH121-00-CN-PM.  Provide and deliver new

fabricated steel for mainlane plaza gantries for future NTTA

projects on State Highway 121 (Denton County). Approximate

quantities include 504,000 pounds of structural steel.

The bid packet is available at no cost to the prospective bid-

der.  Contact Karen at 214-461-2061 for more information. 

The bid packet includes the Proposal book and Plans.  Paper

based bids and supporting documents shall be submitted in

sealed envelopes marked clearly with the project number,

company’s name, and bid opening date.  No oral, telephoned,

or faxed bids will be considered.  Late bids will not be consid-

ered and will be returned unopened.  All rights reserved.

The bid packet may be examined at the NTTA’s main office,

5900 West Plano Parkway, Suite 100, Plano TX 75093.

we “delivered” the
NBLC. Our brother
died, but his work will
live on via the NBLC,
just as when Ken
Bridges died, we con-
vened at the Dudley
Products compound in
Kernersville, and com-
mitted to keep his work
alive.

The NBLC is the cul-
mination of a meeting
held in Cincinnati, Ohio,
on December 9, 2006.
Our theme was “Bring
Back Black.” Now, with
the birth of the NBLC,
we can say, “Black is
Back!” I am proud to be
a part of this movement,
and I invite all of you to
be a part as well. No big
“I’s” and little “U’s.”

We are conscious
Black brothers and sis-
ters who are determined
to serve and, thus, to
lead. We are unapolo-
getic about our love for
Black people, and will
not be sidetracked by the
often-suggested canard
of being accused of hat-
ing others.The NBLC is
not about other folks; it’s
about Black people.

Genuine Black leader-
ship is essential to collec-
tive Black progress. The
general goal of the

NBLC is to gather true
Black leaders, not “lead-
ing Blacks,” as Dr. Julia
Hare calls them, and
build a coalition of indi-
viduals and organiza-
tions from across the
country that will get
busy with the several
tasks at hand for Black
people in America.
Education, Politics,
Communications, and
Economics are crucial to
our survival, and we
must have real leader-
ship in those broad areas
in order to build and
leave a viable future for
our children and their
children.

Our elder, Woodson,
went on to say,
“Negroes, however,
sometimes choose their
own leaders but unfortu-
nately they are too often
the wrong kind. Negroes
do not readily follow
persons with construc-
tive programs.

Almost any sort of
exciting appeal or trivial
matter presented to
them may receive imme-
diate attention and tem-
porarily at least liberal
support. When the bub-
ble collapses, of course,
these same followers will
begin to decry Negro
leadership and call these

misrepresentatives of the
group rascals and
scoundrels. Inasmuch as
they have failed to exer-
cise foresight, however,
those who have deceived
them should be blamed
so much as those who
have liberally supported
these imposters.”

Brothers and sisters,
we cannot continue to
allow Woodson’s warn-
ings to go unheeded. We
love to quote his writ-
ings, but we seldom fol-
low his instructions. The
NBLC not only reveres
what Carter G. taught
us, but we also hold the
teaching of Marcus
Garvey in high regard.

There is nothing that
Black people have not
accomplished in this
world. We are natural
leaders, but some of us
have been polluted and
blinded by greed, self-
aggrandizement, self-
delusion, and self-hate.

As occupants of this
country since its incep-
tion, you must admit
that we should be fur-
ther along than we are
in 2007. The NBLC,
with your assistance
and commitment, will
do everything we can
to reach back to the
accomplishments of

our ancestors and
make us proud once
again.

The NBLC has tal-
ented people in all
areas of work and
endeavor.You are invit-
ed to join; we need you
and your commitment
as well. Please go to
www.bringbackblack.o
rg and check it out,
and then sign up as a

member. We have
much work to do, and
we will get it done.

As it always is, the
time is now; that’s all
we really have – right
now. Bring whatever
talent you have, bring
the love you have,
bring the commitment
you have, and add
them to the NBLC.

That way, the NBLC

will grow, rapidly, into
an even stronger and
more viable organiza-
tion. We gave birth to
the NBLC on October
11th; now it’s up to all
of us to provide the
nourishment necessary
for its strength,
growth, and sustain-
ability. As new fathers
and mothers, please do
your part.

Blackonomics, Page 1

Contact: 972-606-7498 for Career
Opportunity Advertising

to a free community
forum on Tuesday
November 20th, 7:00
p.m.– 9:00 p.m., at the
Johnson Chapel
Community Church
located at 1400 North.
Hampton Road at
Wintergreen in
DeSoto, Texas.

Panelists for the
Pvent will include a
variety of community
leaders, NAACP
Garland Branch
President, B.J.
Williams, Rev. Ronald
Wright – Dallas presi-
dent SCLC, Jordan
Blair – Publisher of the
Elite News, James
Branch – author of the
book, The Vacant Pews,
Bishop Miller E.
Johnson – Sr. Pastor of
new Life Fellowship
Church of Rowlett,TX,
Rev. Wayne L. Stafford
Sr. – Sr. Pastor of
Fellowship Baptist
Church of Allen, TX,
Aaron Michaels
Community Activists
and founder of the

New Black Panthers.
Church Pastors, con-

cerned citizens and all
those interested in
focusing on developing
and building communi-
cations to regain the
loss and missing mem-
bers of the black con-
gregations are invited

to attend. Black Men
are talking and we
should start listening to
meet the needs of the
forgotten tribe. For
more information
please visit
www.bodm.org or call
Rev. F. Karl Banks
(214) 727-3564.

Missing, Page 12
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CITY OF
PLANO, TEXAS

CAREER EMPLOYMENT INFORMATION

www.plano.gov
AA / EOE /ADA

Contact: 972-606-7498 for Career Opportunity Advertising

IRVING
DO YOU WANT AN EXCITING
AND REWARDING CAREER?

PURSUE A CAREER AS A POLICE OFFICER OR FIREFIGHTER!

The City of Irving does not discriminate on the basis of race, sex, reli-
gion, age, or disability in employment or the provision of services.

www.ci.irving.tx.us

SIGN UP TO TAKE 
THE CITY OF IRVING’S NEXT 

CIVIL SERVICE ENTRANCE EXAM. 
CALL (972) 721-2532 TO REGISTER.

•  Competitive wages
•  Array of benefits
•  Education incentive pay
•  . . . and more

Graphic Artist
Needed Part-Time

Candidate Must Know
Quark, Photoshop,

Illustrator & Dreamweaver.
Newspaper Layout A Plus.

Email Resume to trj1909@tx.rr.com
or Leave Message at 972-606-3891

AVON
Would you like to:
• Have financial security and personal fulfillment?
• Create your own hours and be your own boss?
• Develop a profitable home-based business with unlimited earnings?

If your answer is yes, contact Wilma at (972) 222-1699
and become  an Avon Representative.

Age requirement 18, enrollment fee $10.00.

“Ask Me About The $250.00 Bonus Incentive”

CITY OF CARROLLTON
Alternate School Crossing Guard

Civil Engineer-Building Inspection

Concrete Crewmember Maintenance Worker II

Equipment Operator I

HR Specialist-Benefits Administrator

Librarian

Maintenance Crew Leader II—Public Works

Maintenance Worker-Contract

Marketing Director

Senior Code Enforcement Officer

Telecommunications Dispatcher

Telecommunications Shift Supervisor

TV Van Operator/Heavy Equipment Operator
To view/apply for a career opportunity go to:

http://www.cityofcarrollton.com
Click on "Jobs" at the bottom of the page

Click on "Apply Here" to complete your online application
or Call our Job Hotline to hear a list of open positions

Job HotLine: (972) 466-3376
Committed to Quality Customer Service

Equal Opportunity Employer

DALLAS
COUNTY

Accountant I

Accounting Supervisor

Audit Supervisor II

Budget/Policy Analyst I

Internal Auditor II

Internal Auditor III

Qualifications vary for each position.

Visit www.dallascounty.org to apply.

Starting salary is based on education and

experience.  EOE

Dallas County is currently recruiting
for the following positions:

TISEO PAVING COMPANY
419 E. Hwy. 80, Mesquite, TX 75150

Tel: (972) 289-0723  Fax: (972) 216-5637
www.tiseopaving.com

Performing Concrete Street
Paving in the Metroplex Area

We Accept Subcontracting Bids For All
Public Works Project in the Dallas Area

We Are Accepting Applications for
Concrete Mixer Drivers and Heavy

Equipment Mechanics

Equal Opportunity Employer

DALLAS
COUNTY

IT Enterprise Architect
Network Engineer
Sr. Database Administrator
Sr. Developer
Sr. Oracle Application/Database Developer Sr.
Oracle DBA
Sr. Quality Assurance Analyst
Sr. Server Administrator
Sr. UNIX/Sun Systems Administrator

Qualifications vary for each position.
Visit www.dallascounty.org to apply.

Starting salary is based on education and
experience.  EOE

Dallas County is currently recruiting
for the following positions:

Shiloh Missionary Baptist
Church Interviewing and Job

Search Workshop
Are you new to the

job market? Looking to
get your foot in the
door? Not sure how to
get started, where to
look, or what to expect?
Then come to the
Shiloh Missionary
Baptist Church and
learn from their inter-
viewing and job search
workshop created for
you. It is designed for
those entering the
workplace. The work-
shop will cover the
interviewing process
and job searching. This
event is from 9:30 a.m.
to 12:30 p.m., Saturday,
November 10th at the
Shiloh Missionary
Baptist Church 920
East 14th Street Plano,
Texas 75074. Featured
speakers and facilitators
include Elaine Earle,
MA – Leadership &
Human Behavior,
Deann Martin, Job
Search Consultant, and
Pastor Isaiah Joshua,
Jr., M.Ed. Topics of dis-
cussion include: taking
the fear out of inter-
viewing, type of ques-
tions asked, where to
look for jobs, skills and
drug testing, back-
ground checks, personal
appearance, resume for-
mat, and filling out
annoying applications.
If you need help finding
a job come experience
Shiloh Missionary
Baptist Church’s Job
Search Workshop. For

further information,
please call 972-423-
6695.

Store Management
Opportunities

Hobby Lobby is a leader
in the Arts & Crafts indus-
try with 400 stores locat-

ed in 32 states.

Candidates must have previ-
ous retail store management
experience in “one of the fol-
lowing:”

Supermarket chain, Craft chain 
Mass merchant, Drug chain
Building supply chain
Must be willing to relocate.

Benefits include:
• All Stores Closed on Sunday!
• Competitive Salaries 
• Paid Vacations
• 401K Plan
• Medical/Dental
• Life Insurance
• Merchandise Discount
• Flex Spending Plan

Qualified Candidates with Retail
Management experience as listed
above must apply on-line.

www.hobbylobby.com
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Church Happenings

Mt. Olive Church of Plano
300 Chisholm Place   Plano, TX 75075   972-633-5511

WWW.MOCOP.ORG

Serving the Plano
Community for 13 Years

Sunday Worship
10:00 am

Wednesday Night
7:15 pm

Call Pastor Sam on:
“Vision & Truth Live”

Radio Broadcast:  KWRD 100.7 FM   Sundays 9pm – 10pm

HEAR PASTOR SAM DAILY ON:  “TRUTH MADE SIMPLE”
KGGR 1040 AM  MONDAY – FRIDAY @ 5:25pm – 5:30pm

Pastors Sam & Gloria Fenceroy

One, two or three lots for sale at Restland
in North Dallas; located in the beautiful
and peaceful Serenity Gardens Section
(Southeast corner of Greenville Avenue &
Restland Road.) Market value $3450 each,
but selling price negotiable.View plots by
appointment only. Call 972-606-3878,
972-416-6109, or 469-235-5808.

PRIME BURIAL LOTS FOR SALEEBENEZER WORSHIP CENTER
“We are Living Stones in God’s Temple”

SUNDAY
10:00 am: Sunday School

11:00 am: Morning Worship
MONDAY

7:00 pm – 8:30 pm: Men of Power and Women of Power

TUESDAY
7:00 pm- 8:00 pm: Bible Study & Worship ServiceRev. Cecil T. Smith, II

Senior Pastor

14000 Preston Road • Dallas, TX  75254 • 972-980-0977 (Church Phone)

ABUNDANT LIFE
FELLOWSHIP

CHURCH
November 18 4 pm

Please join us for our
Family and Friends
Services at the
Southfork Hotel, 1600
N. Central Expressway,
Plano, TX 75074. Call
972-781-8225 for more
information.
Abundant Life
Fellowship Church
Elder Daniel Richard,
Senior Pastor
1600 N. Central Expy.
Plano,TX 75074
972-781-8225

GRACE 
MISSIONARY 

BAPTIST CHURCH
November 10, 12:30 pm

You are invited to our
2nd Annual Charity
Golf Tournament at
Indian Creek Golf
Course. Funds raised
will be used to build a
Family Center which
will include a gym and
facilities to nourish the
bodies & spirits of the
community. For infor-
mation, golf fees, and
directions, contact Kim
Teamer, 972-636-1334

Grace Missionary
Baptist Church
Rev. Maurice Floyd,
Pastor
1602 College Parkway
Lewisville,TX   75067
972-436-6131

JOHNSON CHAPEL 
COMMUNITY

CHURCH
November 20, 7–9 pm
You don’t want to

miss this Male Forum
hosted by Rev. F. Karl
Banks of the Banks of
Dallas Ministries; “The
Renaissance is in Full
Effect;” Christian
N e t w o r k i n g ,
E m p o w e r m e n t ,
Community Service
and Support. The pan-
elist include: Bishop
Miller Johnson, Jr.,
Senior Pastor of New
Life Fellowship Church
of Rowlett; Rev. Wayne
Stafford, Sr., M.Div,
Senior Pastor of
Fellowship Baptist
Church of Allen; Mr.
James Branch, Author
of “The Vacant Pews”;
Mr. Jordan Blair, Elite
News Editor/Publisher;
Mr. Aaron Micheals,
Community Activist,

Former Leader of New
Black Panthers, KKDA
Radio; Mr. B. J.
Williams, President of
the NAACP in Garland;
and Rev. Ronald Wright,
President SCLC.
Johnson Chapel
Community Church
Dr. Karen Hollie,
Senior Pastor
1400 N. Hampton Rd.
DeSoto,TX   75115

SANCTUARY 
OF PRAISE 

FELLOWSHIP 
OF ALLEN

November 16 – 18, 2007
We invite you to our

Fourth Anniversary
Celebration Services.
Friday at 7:30 pm at the
Allen Civic Center, 300
N. Allen Drive in Allen,
TX will be our “Joy
Night Musical,” this
FREE event  will feature
Minister Ron Hadley
and Worship Squad of
New Orleans; Psalmist
Becky McCadden of
Chesapeake, Virginia;
JaRa and Lineage and
other groups. Saturday
at 7 pm there is a
Celebration Banquet @
the Southfork Hotel in

Plano with guest speak-
er Rev. Josef Rasheed,
Founder/Pastor of
CrossRoad Covenant
Church in DeSoto, TX.
Sunday at 4:40 pm will
be the conclusion of our
anniversary with Pastor
Chuckie Brown of New
Birth Church,
Sherman, TX and his
congregation. For more
information contact
Pastor John Wilson, III
at 469-853-2380.
Sanctuary of Praise
Fellowship of Allen
Rev. John Wilson, III,
Pastor
P.O. Box 633
Allen,TX   75013
469-853-2380

FIRST BAPTIST
CHURCH OF

HAMILTON PARK
(FIRST CHURCH)
November 11 @ 10:30

am
Our Agape Ministry

proudly presents our
3rd Annual “A Salute to
Our Veterans.” Veterans
from all branches of the
Armed Forces will be
recognized on this spe-
cial day during Morning
Worship Services at

10:30 am. This year’s
services will include:
“Special Greetings”
from Governor Rick
Perry (presented by
Miss Fort Worth 2007,
Kristen Blair. The State
of Texas House Rep.,
“Texas Flag
Presentation,” presented
by Miss Dallas 2007,
Corrin Harmon; and
WWII Veterans that cur-
rently attend First
Church will accept the
flag on behalf of all
Veterans. Miss Texas
2006 and the 1st
Runner-Up to Miss
America, Shilah Phillips,
will perform the
National Anthem.
First Baptist Church
of Hamilton Park
(First Church)
Dr. Gregory Foster,
Senior Pastor 
Rev. Anthony Foster,
Co-Pastor
300 East Phillips
Street
Richardson,TX
75081
972-235-4235

SAINT MARK 
BAPTIST CHURCH

November 10, 12 
Noon – 2 pm

Senior Saints (ages 55
and above) please join
us for lunch, bingo and
prizes during the
“Double Nickel
Luncheon” at Newsome
Homes Community
Center, 230 Amscott
Street, McKinney, TX
75069. FREE home
delivery available to
house-bound seniors
within the city only.
Please call 972-542-
6178 no later than
Friday, November 9th
with your name, phone
number, address, and
the number of meals
desired.

November 11, 
11 am & 3:30 pm

You are invited to
Saint Mark Baptist
Church’s 128th Church
Anniversary. There will
guest speakers in both
services, in the morning
and in the afternoon.
Saint Mark Baptist
Church
Rev. Charles Wattley,
Senior Pastor
1308 Wilcox Street
McKinney,TX   75069
972-542-6178
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Sister Tarpley

Macedonia Ministries
702 S. Mill Street • Lewisville, TX  75057

9 7 2 - 4 3 6 - 2 0 1 1

“We Choose Love to Nourish and Cherish One Another”
John 13:34 & Ephesians 5:28-29

www.macedoniaministries.com

Saturday:  Intercessory Prayer @ 7:00 am

Sunday Services:  Sunday School @ 9:30 am • Morning Worship @ 11:00 am

Monday Service:  Men’s Group & Women’s Group Bible Study @ 6:30 pm

Wednesday Service:  Family Bible Study @ 6:30 pm

T.J. Denson, Pastor

New Life Fellowship Church of Rowlett
Bishop Miller E. Johnson, Senior Pastor

New Worship Home
7401 Miller Road • Rowlett, TX 75088

972-463-4964
Sunday Life Bible School  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 9:30 a.m.
Sunday Life Celebration Worship Service  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 10:45 a.m.
First Sunday: Ingredients for Life  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 4:00 p.m.
Wednesdays: Life In The Word Prayer
and Bible Study  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 7:00 p.m.

A Place of New Beginnings. . . II Corinthians 5:17

“The Church with a Vision”

Dr. C. Paul McBride, Pastor

4396 Main Street
The Colony, Texas 75056

(972) 625-8186
website: www.fbc-online.net

Friendship Baptist Church

Schedule of Services:
Sunday

Early Morning Worship

8:00 a.m.

Sunday School Classes

9:30 a.m.

Morning Worship

11:00 a.m.

Evening Worship (1st Sunday)  6:00 p.m.

Tuesday
Early Bird Bible Study 6:00 p.m.

Wednesday
Morning Bible Study   9:30 a.m.
Prayer Meeting and   7:30 p.m.
Evening Bible Study

Mt. Pisgah Missionary Baptist Church
The Rock

Still standing…. Est. June 1864
A Kingdom Building Church offering DELIVERANCE, RESTORATION, PURPOSE and PROSPERITY

Sunday Worship  . . . . . . . . . . . . . 7:45 am & 11:00 am
Sunday School  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 9:45 am – 10:45 am
Wednesday Bible Study  . . . . . 12:00 noon & 7:00 pm

Worship Services

Monday & Friday  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 9:00 am - 3:00 pm
Tuesday, Wednesday & Thursday  . . 9:00 am - 6:00 pm
Saturday & Sunday  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . Closed 

Office Hours

Mt. Pisgah Missionary Baptist Church
11611 Webb Chapel Road • Dallas, TX  75229
Office: 972-241-6151
Email: info@dallasmtpisgah.org
Website: www.dallasmtpisgah.org

Contact Info

Come Experience A
Church that Believes in
Giving God Excellence

Without Excuse

Rev.
Robert Townsend, Pastor

Trust God’s Timing

A friend going through
a trial that seems to be
lasting, to her at least, a
long time, was encour-
aged after reading my
article last week, asking,
“Are You A Carrot, Egg
or Coffee?” She gained a
little more faith, tied a
knot to the end of her

rope, and decided to con-
tinue trusting in God.
The following item
arrived in my mailbox; I
will share this with her
and you.

An old adage says,
“God’s answer to your
prayer is seldom early,
but it is never late!” If
you trust Him, God will
give you the grace you
need when you’re in His
timing. If you keep a
right attitude and not
allow bitterness or
resentment to take hold,
then at the right time, in

due season (if you
faint not); God will
answer your prayers.
The answer may be
“No, or something

different from what you
want or think, but it will
be for your best.
Habakkuk 2 tells us that
God has an appointed
time to answer your
prayers so that you
receive just what you
need at just the right time
to live victoriously and

happily.
Wait for

God’s tim-
ing to
bring these
t h i n g s
a b o u t .
B e l i e v e
that He is
at work in
your life
b r i n g i n g
about what
He knows
is best for
you. You
may wish

to ask for patience as you
faithfully await His
answer. Your situation
will improve, but on
God’s timetable, not
yours!

“For the vision is yet
for an appointed time,
but at the end it shall
speak, and not lie: though
it tarry, wait for it;
because it will surely
come, it will not tarry.”
Habakkuk 2:3.
–Greenville Avenue
Church of Christ
Bulletin.

God Really Does

Care for You—“Casting
all your care upon Him,
for He careth for you.” 1
Peter 5:7.

When you are facing a
problem that is so big it
seems downright irre-
sponsible not to worry
about it. There may not
be a thing you can do
about it, but you feel like
you need to at least be
concerned. After all,
somebody needs to!  Not
a friend or family mem-
ber seems to be volun-
teering for the job.

The devil will attack
your mind and will tell
you that no one cares
about you or your prob-
lem and will try to con-
vince you that you are
alone with this problem.

Instead of giving in to
those evil thoughts, get
your Bible and turn to
scriptures in the Word of
God that guarantees you
that your needs will be
met. Tell God that with
the help of the Holy
Spirit, you won’t take
back your problem. This
is not an easy thing to do;

but every time the prob-
lem comes to your mind,
quote a scripture and
praise God. A pastor
once told his congrega-
tion, you can’t stop
temptations and evil
thoughts from coming to
your mind, but you don’t
have to let them build a
nest there.

The next time you’re
facing a problem, give it
to God. He has volun-
teered for the job and
you can trust Him to do
it well. After all, He really
does care for you.

Things to Ponder –
Your presence is a pres-
ent to the world. You’re
unique and one of a kind.
Your life can be what you
want it to be. Take the
days just one at a time.

Count your blessings,
not your troubles. You’ll
make it through whatever
comes along.
Understand, have
courage, be strong.
Don’t put limits on your-
self. Remember that
life’s treasures are people
. . . together; and not
things.

Sister
Tarpley

Dr. Robert E., Sr. and Mrs. Deloris
Price, Senior Pastor and First Lady of
New Mt. Zion Baptist Church of Dallas 

Gibson (while not about
black people) combined;
but I am appalled at
black people.

The black people call-
ing for him to be fired;
the black people calling
for him to apologize; and
those that would com-
pare this to Imus appall
me. Is Dwayne a racist?
YES. But he admitted
that during the PRI-
VATE phone call
between him and his
son, that was taped with-
out his knowledge, and
submitted to the press.
These were not senti-
ments expressed on his
show or a comedy stage.
This is not another man
who is using the airwaves
to share is racist beliefs,
but one who has had a
personal conversation
exploited. While I com-
pletely disagree with
everything the man said,
I think it is slippery and
dangerous slope when
we begin to demonize
people for their private
conversations. If that is
the case, there are a
whole lot of white,
Latino and Asian people
that need to be fired for
the racism they harbor in
private. OH YEAH
…there will be a lot of
black folks fired that day

too.
I appreciate Duane’s

self-awareness in saying
(in so many words), “I
am a racist, so stay away
from me”. I have more
respect for an honest
racist who admits their
feelings, than a lying
two-face that talks about
tolerance and accept-
ance (even privately), yet
can’t stand anyone dif-
ferent than himself or
herself. Black leadership
needs to focus its atten-
tion on the legitimate,
systemic institutional
racism that continues to
plague this nation from
top to bottom. But that
is a harder fight than tar-
geting a lone bigot, not
worth the energy.
Legitimate leadership
should begin to recog-
nize that.

As a nation, we con-
tinue to miss opportuni-
ties to be honest about
race. People ARE
racists; and will continue
to be. However, if we do
not create a productive
and safe space to discuss
our true feelings, we will
walk around acting like
we all love each other in
the name of political cor-
rectness, when our pri-
vate lives say something
very different. Duane is
not the only one.

Dog Chapman, Page 1
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Healthy Beginnings Child Development Center - 972-404-1412

14120 Noel Road • Dallas, TX 75254
972-239-1120 (Office) • 972-239-5925 (Fax)

templeoffaith_cme@sbcglobal.net (Email)
Dr. Jerome E.

McNeil, Jr., Pastor

Temple of Faith Christian Chapel C.M.E. Church

Sunday Worship Experience - 8:00 am & 10:45 am
Wednesday Bible Study - 12:00 Noon & 7:00 pm

“Where Jesus is the Main Attraction”

Avenue F Church of Christ
1026 Avenue F • Plano, TX  75074 • 972-423-8833
“Our Pilgrimage to Heaven in 2007” -

Hebrews 11:13-16
Sunday Bible Class ............................9:45 am
Sunday Morning Worship ..................10:45 am
Men Bible Class..................................5:00 pm
Women Bible Class ............................5:00 pm
Evening Worship ................................6:00 pm
Wednesday Bible Class ........................7:00 pm

Radio Program @ 7:30 am on KHVN 970 AM Sunday Mornings
Emery Tease, Associate Minister

www.avefchurchofchrist.orgRamon Hodridge, Minister

New Mt. Zion Baptist Church of Dallas
Sunday Service
Morning Worship

7:30 am & 10:30 am
9:00 am Sunday School

Wednesday Service
Prayer Meeting 7:00 pm

Brotherhood 7:00 pm
Missions 7:00 pm

Singles Group 7:00 pm
Bible Study 7:45 pm

Dr. Robert E. Price,
Senior Pastor

A Praying Church Family
“Watchmen on the Walls”

214-341-6459 (Phone) • 214-342-8403 (Fax)
9550 Shepard Road

Dallas, TX 75243

www.nmzb.org (Website) • newmzbc@aol.com (Email)
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Shiloh Missionary Baptist Church
920 E. 14th Street Plano, TX

Pastor Isiah Joshua, Jr.

Sunday Worship Services 8AM & 11AM

For more information call (972) 423-6695
www.shilohbaptistchurch.org

Sunday 9:45AM Sunday School 

Monday 7PM Youth, Brotherhood, Mission 
& Young Adult Ministries

Tuesday 7PM Bible Study & Men’s Choir
Wednesday 7PM Mid-Week Service
Thursday 7PM Mass Choir

Dr. Leslie W Smith,
Senior Pastor

NORTH DALLAS COMMUNITY BIBLE FELLOWSHIP

9 7 2 - 4 3 7 - 3 4 9 3
1010-1020 South Sherman Street • Richardson, TX 75081

www.ndcbf.org

SUNDAY WORSHIP SERVICES:
8:00 AM • 9:30 AM • 11:30 AM

“A Spiritual Oasis for a Thirsty World” Isaiah 55:1

Sunday
Education Ministries - 9:30 a.m. • Worship Celebration - 11:00 am.

– Nursery Facilities Available –

Wednesday    Family Ministries... 7:00 p.m.

Friendly Fellowship with A Family Focus
For More Information Call 972.542.6178

www.saintmarkbc.com • stmarkmissionary@aol.com

1308 Wilcox Street, McKinney TX
Pastor Charles S. Wattley

Saint Mark Missionary
Baptist Church

2007 International and Military Mail 
Holiday Mailing Dates Reminder A Dream, a Vision, a Reality

Monday, November
12 is the deadline for
sending holiday pack-
ages to troops stationed
overseas using Parcel
Post to all Air/Army Post
Office (APO) or Fleet
Post Office (FPO) ZIP
Codes. Dallas District
Manager Carl January
Jr. says “Mail is one of
the greatest morale
boosters we can give our
soldiers, sailors,
Marines, airman, and

Coast Guardsman dur-
ing the holidays.” The
Priority Mail Flat Rate
boxes can be shipped to
any APO/FPO in the
world regardless of
weight, for $8.95. All
packages and mail must
be addressed to individ-
ual service members, as
required by U.S.
Department of Defense
regulations. To see a
table of active APO and
FPO addresses and

mailing restrictions by
individual APO/FPO
ZIP Codes, then go to
pe.usps.com and click
“Postal Bulletins”, then
go to page 58 of the cur-
rent issue and see the
heading “Overseas
Military Mail”. Nothing
sent by Priority Mail
should be sent any later
than December 4. For
additional informantion,
please visit
www.usps.com.

Saint James Church
will be hosting its 6th
Annual Holiday
Banquet “A Dream, a
Vision, a Reality” on
Saturday, November
17, 2007. The
Keynote speaker is
Dr. Wendell Williams,
Grayson College
Vice-President of

Student Affairs. The
Reception and Silent
Auction will begin at
7:00 p.m., with the
banquet following at
7:30 p.m. Join Saint
James Church with
its joyous holiday cel-
ebration at the Hilton
Garden Inn located

at 705 Central Expy.
Allen, Texas  75013.
Admission to this
event is $50.00 per
person, $400.00 for a
table of eight. For
further details or reg-
istration information,
contact Ralph Evans
at 214-542-2552.


